
OUTLOOK BREAKING NEWS 

YOUNG PEOPLE 
ARE LEADING THE 
HIV PREVENTION 
REVOLUTION
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REDUCTIONS IN HIV 
PREVALENCE AMONG 
YOUNG PEOPLE HAVE 
COINCIDED WITH A 
CHANGE IN SEXUAL 
BEHAVIOUR PATTERNS 
AMONG PEOPLE.
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PREVENTING HIV AMONG YOUNG PEOPLE

Young people are leading the prevention revolution by taking definitive action to 
protect themselves from HIV. A change is happening among young people across 
the world, especially in parts of sub-Saharan Africa. Waiting longer to become 
sexually active, young people have fewer multiple partners and there’s an increased 
use of condoms among those with multiple partners. And HIV prevalence among 
young people is dropping in many key countries. 
The impact—HIV prevalence among young people is falling in 16 of the 25 coun-
tries most affected by AIDS.  A ground-breaking study for UNAIDS led by the In-
ternational Group on Analysis of trends in HIV prevalence and behaviours among 
young people shows that these countries with high burden of HIV have either 
achieved or are on track to achieve the international goal of reducing HIV preva-
lence among young people by 25% in 2010 agreed at the International Conference 
on Population and Development in  1994 and endorsed by member states in the 
Declaration of Commitment on HIV/AIDS adopted at the United Nations General 
Assembly Special Session on HIV/AIDS in 2001.
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SCORE CARD
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ACHIEVED
1. BOTSWANA
2. CÔTE D’IVOIRE
3. ETHIOPIA
4. KENYA
5. MALAWI
6. NAMIBIA
7. ZIMBABWE

LIKELY TO ACHIEVE
8. BURUNDI
9. LESOTHO
10. RWANDA
11. SWAZILAND
12. BAHAMAS
13. HAITI 
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COUNTRIES THAT HAVE SIGNIFICANT DECLINES IN HIV PREVALENCE 
AMONG YOUNG PEOPLE TOGETHER WITH CHANGE IN SEXUAL BEHAVIOUR
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TANZANIA
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HIV AMONG YOUNG PEOPLE

An estimated five million young people between the ages of 15 and 24 are living 
with HIV. An estimated 900,000 new HIV infections occurred among young people 
in 2008. Among young people living with HIV, nearly 80% (4 million) live in sub-
Saharan Africa. The HIV epidemic has been harsh on the lives of young women, 
who comprise 66% of infections among young people worldwide. The vast majority 
of these infections among young women occur in sub-Saharan Africa.  More than 
half of all sexually transmitted infections (more than 180 million out of a global an-
nual total of 340 million new infections) other than HIV occur among young people 
ages 15 to 24. 

Programmes to protect young people from HIV must use combination preven-
tion approaches that are young people friendly. In countries with generalized and 
hyperdendemic epidemics, programmes for young people must promote compre-
hensive services that include knowledge about HIV, sexuality education, access to 
sexual and reproductive health services and discussion on harmful sexual norms 
and practices.

FINDINGS

HIV PREVALENCE TRENDS

In 16 countries, HIV prevalence trends among 15-24 year pregnant women showed 
a decline in either urban or rural areas. Of these in 12 countries a decline of 25% or 
more was observed.  In Kenya there was a 60% change between 2000 and 2005. HIV 
prevalence dropped from 14.2% in 2000 to 5.4% in urban areas and from 9.2% to 
3.6% in rural areas in the same period. Similarly in Ethiopia there was a 47% change 
in HIV prevalence among pregnant young women in urban areas and 29% in rural 
areas.  In Malawi  and Cote d’ Ivoire HIV prevalence among pregnant urban young 
women declined by 56% and nearly by half in Burundi and Haiti. In rural areas re-
ductions  of more than one third were observed in Namibia, Zimbabwe,  Botswana, 
Cote d’ Ivoire, Rwanda and Lesotho.

In six of the seven countries with repeated population based HIV surveys, a decline 
of HIV prevalence was seen among young women over time, while only four 
showed a decline among young men. Declines in HIV prevalence among men in 
South Africa and Tanzania have been significant. Similar trends were also observed 
among women in Botswana, Zambia and Zimbabwe. 

BEHAVIOUR TRENDS
Young people in 13 countries are waiting longer before they become sexually active. 
In eight countries these changes were significant for women and in seven countries 
for men between the ages of 15-19.In Cameroon, Ethiopia, Malawi and Zambia, 
both young men and women were reported to be waiting longer before they become 
sexually active.

Young people were also having fewer multiple partners in 13 countries. The study 
found that young men in 13 countries and young women in 10 countries were hav-
ing fewer partners in the last 12 months than in previous years. In seven countries 
there was significant reduction in both young men and women having reduced 
number of partners. These include Cameroon, Cote d’ Ivoire, Ethiopia, Kenya, Tan-
zania, Zambia and Zimbabwe.
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And condom use by young people during last sex act increased in 13 countries. Ten 
countries reported increase in condom use among women while thirteen reported 
increase among men. Only Cameroon, Tanzania and Uganda reported increase in 
condom use among both young men and women.

MAKING SENSE OF HIV PREVALENCE AND 
BEHAVIOUR CHANGE TRENDS FOR YOUNG PEOPLE

HIV prevalence data and behavioural trends could be compared in 11 countries. In 
eight countries—Cote d’ Ivoire, Ethiopia, Kenya, Malawi, Namibia, Tanzania, Zam-
bia and Zimbabwe showed a favourable drop in both—HIV prevalence and at least 
two behavioural indicators for either men or women.  Declines in HIV prevalence 
are likely the result of drops in HIV incidence. Mathematical modelling suggests 
that trends in HIV prevalence among young pregnant women  mirror trends 
among all men and women in the same age group. In two countries—Botswana and 
Zimbabwe significant declines of more than 25% HIV prevalence were observed 
among women in antenatal clinic surveys as well as population based surveys. In 
Zimbabwe, the decline was also seen in a separate cohort study in Manicaland prov-
ince.  Together these data strongly suggest that new HIV infections have dropped 
significantly in the country. Similar trends were seen in other countries, but only 
from a single source of data. For example in Zambia and Tanzania, an independent 
application of a mathematical model to HIV prevalence data from repeat national 
surveys showed significant declines in incidence among young women and men.  

CONCLUSION

UNAIDS has made empowering young people to protect themselves from HIV as a 
priority area. It calls on countries to implement a comprehensive set of programmes 
that put young people’s leadership at the centre of national responses, provide 
rights-based sexual and reproductive health education and services and empower 
young people to prevent sexual and other transmission of HIV infection among 
their peers. This can be achieved by ensuring access to HIV testing and prevention 
efforts with and for young people in the context of sexuality education. And by 
ensuring enabling legal environments, education and employment opportunities to 
reduce vulnerability to HIV. 

Young people have shown that they can be change agents in the prevention revolution. 
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