O:\ERN\ERN09560.LC S.L.C.

S O XX 9 N A WN -

S e S S VG
AN U bW NN

DIVISION B—TAX, UNEMPLOY-
MENT, HEALTH, STATE FIS-
CAL RELIEF, AND OTHER
PROVISIONS
TITLE I—TAX PROVISIONS

SEC. 1000. SHORT TITLE, ETC.

(a) SHORT TiTLE.—This title may be cited as the

“American Recovery and Reinvestment Tax Act of 2009”.

(b) REFERENCE.—Except as otherwise expressly pro-
vided, whenever in this title an amendment or repeal is
expressed in terms of an amendment to, or repeal of, a
section or other provision, the reference shall be consid-
ered to be made to a section or other provision of the In-
ternal Revenue Code of 1986.

(¢) TABLE OF CONTENTS.—The table of contents for

this title is as follows:
TITLE I—TAX PROVISIONS
Sec. 1000. Short title, ete.
Subtitle A—Tax Relief for Individuals and Families

PART I—GENERAL TAX RELIEF

Sec. 1001. Making work pay credit.

Sec. 1002, Temporary increase in earned income tax credit.

Sec. 1003. Temporary increase of refundable portion of child eredit.

Sec. 1004. American opportunity tax credit.

Sec. 1005. Computer technology and equipment allowed as a qualified higher
education expense for section 529 accounts in 2009 and 2010.

Sec. 1006. Extension of and increase in first-time homebuyer credit; waiver of
requirement to repay.

Sece. 1007. Suspension of tax on portion of unemployment compensation.



O:\ERN\ERN09560.L.C ’ S.L.C.

Sec.

Sec.

Sec.

Sec.

Sec.
Sec.

See.

2

1008. Additional deduction for State sales tax and excise tax on the pur-
chase of certain motor vehicles.

PART II—ALTERNATIVE MINIMUM TAX RELIEF

1011. Extension of alternative minimum tax relief for nonrefundable per-
sonal credits.
1012. Extension of increased alternative mininmum tax exemption amount.

Subtitle B—Energy Incentives

PART I—RENEWABLE ENERGY INCENTIVES

1101. Extension of credit for electricity produced from certain renewable
resources.

1102, Election of investment credit in lien of production credit.

1103. Repeal of certain limitations on credit for renewable energy prop-
erty.

1104. Coordination with renewable energy grants.

PART TT—INCREASED ALLOCATIONS OF NEW CLEAN RENEWABLE ENERGY

Sec.

See.

Sec.

Sec.
Sec.

Sec.

See.
See.
See.
Seec.

Sec.

BoNDS AND QUALIFIED ENERGY CONSERVATION BONDS

1111. Increased limnitation on issuance of new clean renewable energy
bonds.

1112. Increased limitation on issuance of qualified energy conservation
bonds.

PART III—ENERGY CONSERVATION INCENTIVES

1121. Extension and modification of credit for nonbusiness energy prop-
erty.

1122. Modification of credit for residential energy efficient property.

1123, Temporary increase in credit for alternative fuel vehicle refueling
property.

PART IV—MODIFICATION OF CREDIT FOR CARBON DIOXIDE
SEQUESTRATION

1131. Application of monitoring requirements to carbon dioxide used as a
tertiary injectant.

PART V—PLUG-IN ELECTRIC DRIVE MOTOR VEHICLES

1141. Credit for new qualified plug-in electric drive motor vehicles.

1142, Credit for certain plug-in electric vehicles.

1143. Conversion kits.

1144, Treatment of alternative motor velhicle credit as a personal credit al-
lowed against AMT.

PART VI—PARITY FOR TRANSPORTATION FRINGE BENEFITS

1151. Increased exclusion amount for commuter transit benefits and tran-
sit passes.

Subtitle C—Tax Incentives for Business

PART I—TEMPORARY INVESTMENT INCENTIVES



O:\ERN\ERN09560.LC

Sec.
Sec.

Sec.
Sec.

Sec.

Sec.

Sec.

See.

Sec.

Sec.

Sec.

Sec.

Sec.

Sec.
See.
Sec.
Sec.

Sec.

Sec.

1241.

1251.

1261.

1262.

1301.

1302.

1401.
1402.
1403.
1404.

S.L.C.
3

. Special allowance for certain property acquired during 2009.
. Temporary increase in limitations on expensing of certain depre-

ciable business assets.

PART II—SMALL BUSINESS PROVISIONS

. b-year carryback of operating losses of small businesses.
. Decreased required estimated tax payments in 2009 for certain

small businesses.

PART III—INCENTIVES FOR NEW JOBS

. Incentives to hire unemployed veterans and disconnected youth.

PART IV—RULES RELATING TO DEBT INSTRUMENTS

. Deferral and ratable inclusion of income arising from business in-

debtedness discharged by the reacquisition of a debt instru-
ment.

. Modifications of rules for original issue discount on certain high

vield obligations.

PART V—QUALIFIED SMALL BUSINESS STOCK

Special rules applicable to qualified small business stock for 2009
and 2010.

PART VI—S CORPORATIONS

Temporary reduction in recognition period for built-in gains tax.

PART VII—RULES RELATING TO OWNERSHIP CHANGES

Clarification of regulations related to limitations on certain built-in
losses following an ownership change.

Treatment of certain ownership changes for purposes of limitations
on net operating loss carryforwards and certain built-in losses.

Subtitle D—Manufacturing Recovery Provisions

Temporary expansion of availability of industrial development bonds
to facilities manufacturing intangible property.
Credit for investment in advanced energy facilities.

Subtitle E—Economic Recovery Tools

Recovery zone bouds.

Tribal economic development bonds.

Increase in new markets tax credit.

Coordination of low-income housing credit and low-income housing
grants.

Subtitle F—Infrastructure Financing Tools

PART I—IMPROVED MARKETABILITY FOR TAX-EXEMPT BONDS

1501.

1502.

De minimis safe harbor exception for tax-exempt interest expense of
financial institutions.

Modification of small issuer exception to tax-exempt interest expense
allocation rules for financial institutions.



O:\ERN\ERN09560.LC S.L.C.
4

See. 1503. Temporary modification of alternative minimuwm tax limitations on
tax-exempt bonds.
Sec. 1504. Modification to high speed intercity rail facility bonds.

PART II—DELAY IN APPLICATION OF WITHHOLDING TAX ON GOVERNMENT
CONTRACTORS

See. 1511. Delay in application of witliholding tax on government contractors.

PART III—Tax CREDIT BONDS FOR SCHOOLS

Sec. 1521. Qualified school construction bonds.
Sec. 1522. Extension and expansion of qualified zone academy bonds.

PART IV—BUILD AMERICA BONDS
See. 1531, Build America bonds.

PART V—REGULATED INVESTMENT COMPANIES ALLOWED TO PASS-THRU
Tax CREDIT BOND CREDITS

Sec. 1541. Regulated investment companies allowed to pass-thru tax credit
bond credits.

Subtitle G—Other Provisions

Sec. 1601. Application of certain labor standards to projects financed with cer-
tain tax-favored bonds.

Sec. 1602. Grants to States for low-income housing projects in Heu of low-in-
come housing eredit allocations for 2009.

Sec. 1603. Grants for specified energy property in lien of tax credits.

Sec. 1604. Increase i public debt limit.

Subtitle H—Prohibition on Collection of Certain Payments Made Under the
Continned Dumping and Subsidy Offset Act of 2000

Sec. 1701. Prohibition on collection of certain payments made under the Con-
tinued Dumping and Subsidy Offset Act of 2000.

Subtitle I—Trade Adjustment Assistance

See. 1800. Short title.
PART I—TRADE ADJUSTMENT ASSISTANCE FOR WORKERS

SUBPART A—TRADE ADJUSTMENT ASSISTANCE FOR SERVICE SECTOR
WORKERS

Sec. 1801. Extension of trade adjustment assistance to service sector and pub-
lic agency workers; shifts in production.

Sec. 1802. Separate basis for certification.

See. 1803. Determinations by Secretary of Labor.

Sec. 1804. Monitoring and reporting relating to service sector.

SUBPART B—INDUSTRY NOTIFICATIONS FOLLOWING CERTAIN AFFIRMATIVE
DETERMINATIONS

Sec. 1811. Notifications following certain affirmative determinations.
Sec. 1812. Notification to Secretary of Commerce.



O:\ERN\ERN09560.L.C

Sec.
Sec.
Sec.

Sec.
Sec.

Sec.
Sec.

Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Seec.
Sec.

Sec.

1821
1822
1823

1824
1825

1826
1827

1828
1829
1830
1831
1832

1833

S.L.C.

5
SUBPART C—PROGRAM BENEFITS

. Qualifying Requirements for Workers.

. Weekly amounts.

. Limitations on trade readjustment allowances; allowances for ex-
tended training and breaks in training.

. Special rules for caleculation of eligibility period.

. Application of State laws and regulations on good cause for waiver
of time limits or late filing of claims.

. Employment and case managenment services.

. Administrative expenses and employment and case management
services.

. Training funding.

. Prerequisite education; approved training programs.

. Pre-layoff and part-time training.

. On-the-job training.

. Eligibility for unemployment insurance and program benefits while
in training. '

. Job search and relocation allowances.

SUBPART D—REEMPLOYMENT TRADE ADJUSTMENT ASSISTANCE PROGRAM

Sec. 1841. Reewmployment trade adjustment assistance program.

Sec.
Sec.

Sec.
Sec.
Seec.
Seec.
Sec.
Sec.

Seec.
Seec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.

Sec.
Sec.
See.

Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.

1851
1852

1853
1854
1855
1856
1857
1858

1861.
1862.
1863.
1864.
1865.
1866.
1867.

SUBPART E—OTHER MATTERS

. Office of Trade Adjustment Assistance.

. Accountability of State agencies; collection and publication of pro-
gram data; agreements with States.

. Verification of eligibility for program benefits.

. Collection of data and reports; information to workers.

. Frand and recovery of overpayments.

. Sense of Congress on application of trade adjustment assistance.

. Consultations in promulgation of regulations.

. Techuical corrections.

PART II—TRADE ADJUSTMENT ASSISTANCE FOR IFIRMS

Expansion to service sector firms.

Modification of requirements for certification.

Basis for determinations.

Oversight and administration; authorization of appropriations.
Increased penalties for false statements.

Amual report on trade adjustment assistance for firms.
Technical corrections.

PART III—TRADE ADJUSTMENT ASSISTANCE FOR COMMUNITIES

1871
1872
1873

. Purpose.
. Trade adjustment assistance for conununities.
. Conforming amendments.

PART IV—TRADE ADJUSTMENT ASSISTANCE FOR FARMERS

1881
1882
1883
1884

. Definitions.
. Eligibility.
. Benefits.

. Report.



O:\ERN\ERN09560.L.C

SO O 0 3N W

See.
See.
Seec.

Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Seec.

Sec.
Sec.
Sec.

Seec.

Sec.

Sec.
Sec.

Sec.

Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
See.

1885.
1886.
1887.

1891.
1892.
1893.
1894.

S.L.C.
6

Fraud and recovery of overpayments.
Determination of increases of imports for certain fishermen.
Extension of trade adjustinent assistance for farmers.

PART V—GENERAL PROVISIONS

Effective date.

Extension of trade adjustment assistance programs.
Termination; related provisions.

Government Accountability Office report.

1895. Emergency designation.

1899.

PART VI—HEALTH COVERAGE IMPROVEMENT

Short title.

1899A. Improvement of the affordability of the credit.
1899B. Payment for monthly premiwns paid prior to commencement of

1899C.

1899D

advance payments of credit.
TAA recipients not enrolled in training programs eligible for cred-
it.
. TAA pre-certification pertod rule for purposes of determining
wlhether there is a 63-day lapse in creditable coverage.

1899E. Continued qualification of family members after certain events.
1899F. Extension of COBRA benefits for certain TAA-eligible individuals

and PBGC recipients.

1899G. Addition of coverage through voluntary employees’ beneficiary as-

1899H
18991.
1899J.

sociations.
. Notice requirements.
Swrvey and report on enhanced health coverage tax credit program.
Authorization of appropriations.

1899K. Extension of national emergency grants.
1899L. GAO study and report.

Subtitle A—Tax Relief for

Individuals and Families
PART I—GENERAL TAX RELIEF

SEC. 1001. MAKING WORK PAY CREDIT.

(a)

IN GENERAL.—Subpart C of part IV of sub-

chapter A of chapter 1 is amended by inserting after sec-

tion 36 the following new section:

“SEC. 36A. MAKING WORK PAY CREDIT.

“(a) ALLOWANCE OF CREDIT.—In the case of an eli-

gible individual, there shall be allowed as a eredit against



O:\ERN\ERN09560.LC S.L.C.

7

1 the tax imposed by this subtitle for the taxable year an

2
3

O 0 3 N »n K

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

amount equal to the lesser of—

“(1) 6.2 percent of earned income of the tax-
payer, or

“(2) $400 ($800 in the case of a joint return).
“(b) LIMITATION BASED ON MODIFIED ADJUSTED

GROSS INCOME.—

“(1) IN GENERAL.—The amount allowable as a
credit under subsection (a) (determined without re-
gard to this paragraph and subsection (¢)) for the
taxable year shall be reduced (but not below zero) by
2 percent of so much of the taxpayer’s modified ad-
justed gross income as exceeds $75,000 ($150,000
in the case of a joint return).

“(2) MODIFIED ADJUSTED GROSS INCOME.—
For purposes of subpara,gl“aph (A), the term ‘modi-
fied adjusted gross income’ means the adjusted
gross income of the taxpayer for fhe taxable year in-
creased by any amount excluded from gross income
under section 911, 931, or 933.

“(¢) REDUCTION FOR CERTAIN OTHER PAY-
MENTS.—The credit allowed under subsection (a) for any
taxable year shall be reduced by the amount of any pay-
ments received by the taxpayer during such taxable year

under section 2201, and any credit allowed to the taxpayer



0:\ERN\ERN09560.LC S.L.C.
8

1 under section 2202, of the American Recovery and Rein-
2 vestment Tax Act of 2009.
3 “(d) DEFINITIONS AND SPECIAL RULES.—For pur-

4 poses of this section—

5 “(1) ELIGIBLE INDIVIDUAL.—

6 “(A) IN GENERAL.—The term ‘eligible in-

7 dividual’ means any individual other than—

8 ““(i) any nonresident alien individual,

9 “(ii) any individual with respect to
10 whom a deduction under section 151 is al-
11 lowable to another taxpayer for a taxable
12 year beginning in the calendar year in
13 which the individual’s taxable year begins,
14 and
15 “(ui) an estate or trust.

16 “(B) IDENTIFICATION NUMBER REQUIRE-
17 MENT.—Such term shall not include any indi-
18 vidual who does not include on the return of tax
19 for the taxable year—

20 0 - “(1) such individual’s social security
21 | account number, and

22 “(ii) in the case of a joint return, the
23 social security account number of one of

24 the taxpayers on such return.



O:\ERN\ERN09560.LC

O 0 N N R WN -

N N NN NN = e e e e s s
h = W N =, ©O VOV o0 3 &0 n h W N = ©

S.L.C.
9

For purposes of the preceding sentence, the so-
cial security account number shall not include a
TIN issued by the Internal Revenue Service.

“(2) EARNED INCOME.—The term ‘earned in-

come’ has the meaning given such term by section
32(e)(2), except that such term shall not include net
earnings from self-employment which are not taken
into account in computing taxable income. For pur-
poses of the preceding sentence, any amount ex-
cluded from gross income by reason of section 112
shall be treated as éarned income which is taken
into aceount in ecomputing taxable income for the
taxable year.

‘““(e) TERMINATION.—This section shall not apply to

taxable years beginning after December 31, 2010.”.

(b) TREATMENT OF POSSESSIONS.—

(1) PAYMENTS TO POSSESSIONS.—

(A) MIRROR CODE POSSESSION.—The Sec-
retary of the Treasury shall pay to each posses-
sion of the United States with a mirror code
tax system amounts equal to the loss to that
possession by reason of the amendments made
by this section with respect to taxable years be-
ginning in 2009 and 2010. Such amounts shall
be determined by the Secretary of the Treasury



O:\ERN\ERN09560.LC

O o0 ~ AN W W [\ —_

N\ [\ [\ \®} [\ [\ p— p— —_ — — —_ — — —_ —
W N (W8] (\®) —_ ) \O o0 ~ (@) ()] EaN W [\ —_ (e}

S.L.C.
10

based on information provided by the govern-

ment of the respective possession.

(B) OTHER POSSESSIONS.—The Secretary
of the Treasury shall pay to each possession of
the United States which does not have a mirror
code tax system amounts estimated by the Sec-
retary of the Treasury as being equal to the ag-
gregate benefits that would have been provided
to residents of such possession by reason of the
amendments made by this section for taxable
years beginning in 2009 and 2010 if a mirror
code tax system had been in effect in such pos-
session. The preceding sentence shall not apply
with respect to any possession of the United
States unless such possession has a plan, which
has been approved by the Secretary of the
Treasury, under which such possession will
promptly distribute such payments to the resi-
dents of such possession.

(2) COORDINATION WITH CREDIT ALLOWED
AGAINST UNITED STATES INCOME TAXES.—No cred-
it shall be allowed against United States income
taxes for any taxable year under section 36A of the
Internal Revenue Code of 1986 (as added by this

section) to any person—



O:\ERN\ERN09560.L.C

O 0 N N W W =

NN N N N N M) R e e e e e e
“wn A W N = O O 0 NN N BRAW =, D

S.L.C.
11

(A) to whom a credit is allowed against
taxes 1mposed by the possession by reason of
the amendments made by this section for such
taxable year, or

(B) who is eligible for a payment under a
plan described in paragraph (1)(B) with respect
to such taxable year.

(3) DEFINITIONS AND SPECIAL RULES.—

(A) DPOSSESSION OF THE UNITED
STATES.—For purposes of this subsection, the
term ‘‘possession of the United States’ includes
the Commonwealth of Puerto Rico and the
Commonwealth of the Northern Mariana Is-
lands.

(B) MIRROR CODE TAX SYSTEM.—FKor pur-
poses of this subsection, the term ‘“mirror code
tax system’” means, with respect to any posses-
sion of the United States, the income tax sys-
tem of such possession if the income tax liabil-
ity of the residents of such possession under
such system 1s defermined by reference to the
income tax laws of the United States as if such
possession were the United States.

(C) TREATMENT OF PAYMENTS.—For pur-

poses of section 1324(b)(2) of title 31, United



O:\ERN\ERN09560.LC S.L.C.

O 00 3 N W B W =

N N N N N —m Fm o ke e e e e
AW NN = O O X N N R WY =D

12
States Code, the payments under this sub-
section shall be treated in the same manner as
a refund due from the credit allowed under sec- -
tion 36A of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986
(as added by this section).

(¢) REFUNDS DISREGARDED IN THE ADMINISTRA-
TION OF FEDERAL PROGRAMS AND KFEDERALLY AS-
SISTED PROGRAMS.—Any credit or refund allowed or
made to any individual by reason of section 36A of the
Internal Revenue Code of 1986 (as added by this section)
or by reason of subsection (b) of this seetion shall not be
taken into account as income and shall not be taken into
account as resources for the month of receipt and the fol-
lowing 2 months, for purposes of determining the eligi-
bility of such individual or any other individual for benefits
or assistance, or the amount or extent of benefits or assist-
ance, under any Federal program or under any State or
local program financed in whole or in part with Federal
funds.

(d) AUTHORITY RELATING TO CLERICAL ERRORS.—
Section 6213(g)(2) is amended by striking “and” at the
end of subpara.graph (L) (i1), by striking the period at the
end of subparagraph (M) and inserting “, and”, and by
adding at the end the following new subparagraph:



O:\ERN\ERN09560.LC

\O oo ~J AN W EEN W N —_

— e e ed e
DN A W N =D

“Sec.

16

S.L.C.
13

“(N) an omission of the reduction required
under section 36A(c) with respect to the credit
allowed under section 36A or an omission of the
correct social security account number required
under section 36A(d)(1)(B).”.

(e) CONFORMING AMENDMENTS.—

(1) Section 6211(b)(4)(A) is amended by insert-
ing “36A," after “36,”.

(2) Section 1324(b)(2) of title 31, United
States Code, is amended by inserting ‘“36A,” after
“36,”.

(3) The table of sections for subpart C of part
IV of subchapter A of chapter 1 is amended by in-
serting after the item relating to section 36 the fol-

lowing new item:
36A. Making work pay credit.”.

(f) EFFECTIVE DATE.—This section, and the amend-

17 ments made by this section, shall apply to taxable years

18 beginning after December 31, 2008.

19 SEc.
20
21

1002. TEMPORARY INCREASE IN EARNED INCOME TAX
CREDIT.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Subsection (b) of section 32 is

22 amended by adding at the end the following new para-

23 graph:



O:\ERN\ERN09560.LC S.L.C.

14

1 “(3) SPECIAL RULES FOR 2009 AND 2010.—In
2 the case of any taxable year beginning in 2009 or
3 2010—

4 “(A) INCREASED CREDIT PERCENTAGE
5 FOR 3 OR MORE QUALIFYING CHILDREN.—In
6 the case of a taxpayer with 3 or more qualifying
7 children, the credit percentage is 45 percent.

8 ‘“‘‘B) REDUCTION OF MARRIAGE PEN-
9 ALTY.—

10 “(i) IN GENERAL.—The dollar amount
11 in effect under paragraph (2)(B) shall be
12 $5,000.

13 “(i1) INFLATION ADJUSTMENT.—In
14 the case of any taxable year beginning in
15 2010, the $5,000 amount in clause (i)
16 shall be increased by an amount equal to—
17 “(I) such dollar amount, multi-
18 plied by

19 “(II) the cost of living adjust-
20 ment determined under section 1(f)(3)
21 for the calendar year in which the tax-
22 able year begins determined by sub-
23 stituting ‘calendar year 2008’ for ‘cal-
24 endar year 1992’ in subparagraph (B)

25 thereof.



O:\ERN\ERN09560.LC S.L.C.

O 00 3 Y b kWD =

N N NN N /m ke e e e e e
A W D=, O 0O 0N R WD =, O

15
“(iii) ROUNDING.—Subparagraph (A)
of subsection (j)(2) shall apply after taking
Into aeccount any increase under clause
(i1).”.

(b) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by
this section shall apply to taxable years beginning after
December 31, 2008.

SEC. 1003. TEMPORARY INCREASE OF REFUNDABLE POR-
TION OF CHILD CREDIT.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Paragraph (4) of section 24(&) is
amended to read as follows:

“(4) SPECIAL RULE FOR 2009 AND 2010.—Not-
withstanding paragraph (3), in the case of any tax-
able year beginning in 2009 or 2010, the dollar
amount in effect for such taxable year under para-
graph (1)(B)(i) shall be $3,000.”.

(b) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by
this section shall apply to taxable years beginning after
December 31, 2008.

SEC. 1004. AMERICAN OPPORTUNITY TAX CREDIT.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 25A (relating to Hope
scholarship credit) is amended by redesignating subsection
(1) as subsection (j) and by inserting after subsection (h)

the following new subsection:



O:\ERN\ERN09560.L.C

O 00 0 N W B W N

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

S.L.C.
16

“(1) AMERICAN OPPORTUNITY TAX CREDIT.—In the

case of any taxable year beginning in 2009 or 2010—

“(1) INCREASE IN CREDIT.—The Hope Scholar-
ship Credit shall be an amount equal to the sum
of—

“(A) 100 percent of so much of the quali-
fied tuition and related expenses paid by the
taxpayer during the taxable year (for education
furnished to the eligible student during any
academic period beginning in such taxable year)
as does not exceed $2,0.00, plus

“(B) 25 percent of such expenses so paid
as exceeds $2,000 but does not exceed $4,000.
“(2) CREDIT ALLOWED FOR FIRST 4 YEARS OF

POST-SECONDARY EDUCATION.—Subparagraphs (A)
and (C) of subsection (b)(2) shall be applied by sub-
stituting ‘4’ for ‘2’

“(3) QUALIFIED TUITION AND RELATED EX-
PENSES TO INCLUDE REQUIRED COURSE MATE-
RIALS.—Subsection (£)(1)(A) shall be applied by
substituting ‘tuition, fees, and course materials’ for
‘tuition and fees’.

“(4) INCREASE IN AGI LIMITS FOR HOPE
SCHOLARSHIP CREDIT.—In lieu of applying sub-

section (d) with respect to the Hope Scholarship



O:\ERN\ERN09560.LC

O 00 0 N O bAWN =

NN N N N N = ke e e e e e
wnm AW N = OO NN DR W e D

S.L.C.
17
Credit, such credit (determined without regard to

this paragraph) shall be reduced (but not below
zero) by the amount which bears the same ratio to
such credit (as so determined) as—
“(A) the excess of—
‘(i) the taxpayer’s modified adjusted
gross income (as defined in subsection
(d)(3)) for such taxable year, over
“(i) $80,000 ($160,000 in the case of
a joint return), bears to
“(B) $10,000 ($20,000 in the case of a
joint return).

“(5)‘ CREDIT ALLOWED AGAINST ALTERNATIVE
MINIMUM TAX—In the case of a taxable year to
which section 26(a)(2) does not apply, so much of |
the credit allowed under subsection (a) as is attrib-
utable to the Hope Scholarship Credit shall not ex-
ceed the excess of— |

“(A) the sum of the regular tax liability
(as defined in section 26(b)) plus the tax im-
posed by section 55, over

“(B) the sum of the credits allowable
under this subpart (other than this subsection

and sections 23, 25D, and 30D) and section 27

for the taxable year.



O:\ERN\ERN09560.LC

o X 3 N W B W N =

N RN N N N N M= s e e s s e
hn A W N =, © YWV 0 3 O B A W N~ O

S.L.C.
18

Any reference in this section or section 24, 25, 26,
25B, 904, or 1400C to a credit allowable under this
subsection shall be treated as a reference to so much
of the credit allowable under subsection (a) as is at-
tributable to the Hope Scholarship Credit.

“(6) PORTION OF CREDIT MADE REFUND-
ABLE.—40 percent of so much of the eredit allowed
under subsection (a) as is attributable to the Hope
Scholarship Credit (determined after application of
paragraph (4) and without regard to this paragraph
and section 26(a)(2) or paragraph (5), as the case
may be) shall be treated as a credit allowable under
subpart C (and not aﬂowed under subsection (a)).
The preceding sentence shall not apply to any tax-
payer for any taxable year if such taxpayer is a child
to whom subsection (g) of section 1 applies for such
taxable year.

“(7) COORDINATION WITH MIDWESTERN DIS-
ASTER AREA BENEFITS.—In the case of a taxpayer
with respect to whom section 702(a)(1)(B) of the
Heartland Disaster Tax Relief Aet of 2008 applies
for any taxable year, such taxpayer may elect to
waive the application of this subsection to such tax-
payer for such taxable year.”.

(b) CONFORMING AMENDMENTS.—



O:\ERN\ERN09560.LC

O 00 9 AN W R~ WN

N NN N NN = e e e e e e e
hn h W N = © W 00 ~J N U AW NN = O

S.L.C.
19
(1) Section 24(b)(3)(B) is amended by inserting
“25A(i),” after “23,”.
(2) Section 25(e)(1)(C)(i1) is amended by in-
serting “25A(1),” after “24,”.
(3
“25A(1),” after “24,”.

Section 26(a)(1) is amended by inserting

“25A(1),” after “23,”.
(5
“25A(1),” after “24,”.
(6) Section 1400C(d)(2) is amended by insert-

)
)

(4) Section 25B(g)(2) is amended by inserting
)
) Section 904(i) is amended by inserting
)

ing “25A(1),” after “24,”.

(7) Section 6211(b)(4)(A) is amended by insert-
ing “25A by reason of subsection (i)(6) thereof,”
after “24(d),”.

(8) Section 1324(b)(2) of title 31, United
States Code, 1s amended by inserting “25A,” before
“35”.

(¢) TREATMENT OF POSSESSIONS.—

(1) PAYMENTS TO POSSESSIONS.—

(A) MIRROR CODE POSSESSION.—The Sec-
retary of the Treasury shall pay to each posses-
sion of the United States with a mirror code
tax system amounts equal to the loss to that

possession by reason of the application of see-



O:\ERN\ERN09560.LC

O 00 9 N B~ WND

N NN NN Mk e e e e e e e
AW NN = O O 0 NN Bl WNN=R, o

S.L.C.
20
tion 25A(1)(6) of the Internal Revenue Code of

1986 (as added by this section) with respect to
taxable years beginning in 2009 and 2010.
Such amounts shall be determined by the Sec-
retary of the Treasury based on information
provided by the government of the respective
possession.

(B) OTHER POSSESSIONS.—The Secretary
of the Treasury shall pay to each possession of
the United States which does not have a mirror
code tax system amounts estimated by the Sec-
retary of the Treasury as being equal to the ag-
gregate benefits that would have been provided
to residents of such possession by reason of the
application of section 25A(1)(6) of such Code
(as so added) for taxable years beginning in
2009 and 2010 if a mirror code tax system had
been mn effect in such possession. The preceding
sentence shall not apply with respect to any
possession of the United States unless such pos-
session has a plan, which has been approved by
the Secretary of the Treasury, under which
such possession will promptly distribute such

payments to the residents of such possession.



O:\ERN\ERN09560.LC

O 0 9 N R W e

NN NN N N M e e e e e e
DL N W N = O O 0 N RN W Rk, o

S.L.C.
21

(2) COORDINATION WITH CREDIT ALLOWED
AGAINST UNITED STATES INCOME TAXES.—Section
25A(1)(6) of such Code (as added by this section)
shall not apply to a bona fide resident of any posses-
sion of the United States.

(3) DEFINITIONS AND SPECIAL RULES.—

(A) POSSESSION OF THE UNITED
STATES.—For purposes of this subsection, the
term ‘‘possession of the United States” includes
the Commonwealth of Puerto Rico and the
Commonwealth of the Northern Mariana Is-
lands.

(B) MIRROR CODE TAX SYSTEM.—For pur-
poses of this subsection, the term ‘“‘mirror code

b

tax system’’ means, with respect to any posses-
sion of the United States, the income tax sys-
tem of such possession if the income tax liabil-
ity of the residents of such possession under
such system is determined by reference to the
income tax laws of the United States as if such
possession were the United States.

(C) TREATMENT OF PAYMENTS.—For pur-
poses of section 1324(b)(2) of title 31, United
States Code, the payments under this sub-

section shall be treated in the same manner as



O:\ERN\ERN09560.LC S.L.C.

O 0 3 N W bR WD~

N NN N N = e e e e e e e e
AW D= O 0O 00NN RN W=D

22

a refund due from the credit allowed under sec-
tion 25A of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986
by reason of subsection (i)(6) of such section
(as added by this section).

(d) EFrFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by
this section shall apply to taxable years beginning after
December 31, 2008.

(e) APPLICATION OF EGTRRA SUNSET.—The
amendment made by subsection (b)(1) shall be subject to
title IX of the Economic Growth and Tax Relief Reconcili-
ation Act of 2001 in the same manner as the provision
of such Act to which such amendment relates.

(f) TREASURY STUDIES REGARDING EDUCATION IN-
CENTIVES.— |

(1) STUDY REGARDING COORDINATION WITH

NON-TAX STUDENT FINANCIAL ASSISTANCE.—The

Secretary of the Treasury and the Secretary of Edu-

cation, or their delegates, shall—

(A) study how to coordinate the credit al-
lowed under section 25A of the Internal Rev-
enue Code of 1986 with the Federal Pell Grant
program under section 401 of the Higher Edu-
cation Act of 1965 to maximize their effective-

ness at promoting college affordability, and



O:\ERN\ERN09560.LC

O 00 3 O U B WN e

e e e e e e
AN U WD = O

SEC.

N = =
S O oo

S.L.C.
23
(B) examine ways to expedite the delivery

of the tax credit.

(2) STUDY REGARDING INCLUSION OF COMMU-
NITY SERVICE REQUIREMENTS.—The Secretary of
the Treasury and the Secretary of Eduecation, or
their delegates, shall study the feasibility of requir-
g including community service as a condition of
taking their tuition and related expenses into ac-
count under section 25A of the Internal Revenue
Code of 1986.

(3) REPORT.—Not later than 1 year after the
date of the enactment of this Act, the Secretary of
the Treasury, or the Secretary’s delegate, shall re-
port to Congress on the results of the studies con-
ducted under this paragraph.

1005. COMPUTER TECHNOLOGY AND EQUIPMENT AL-
LOWED AS A QUALIFIED HIGHER EDUCATION
EXPENSE FOR SECTION 529 ACCOUNTS IN
2009 AND 2010.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 529(e)(3)(A) 1s amended

21 by striking “and” at the end of clause (i), by striking the

22 period at the end of clause (ii), and by adding at the end

23 the following:

24
25

“(iii) expenses paid or incurred in

2009 or 2010 for the purchase of any com-



O:\ERN\ERN09560.L.C S.L.C.

24

1 puter technology or equipment (as defined
2 in section 170(e)(6)(¥)(i)) or Internet ac-
3 cess and related services, if such tech-
4 nology, equipment, or services are to be
5 used by the beneficiary and the bene-
6 ficiary’s family during any of the years the
7 beneficiary is enrolled at an eligible edu-
8 cational institution. |
9 Clause (ii1) shall not include expenses for com-
10 pﬁter software designed for sports, games, or
11 hobbies unless the software is predominantly
12 educational in nature.”.

13 (b) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by

14 this section shall apply to expenses paid or incurred after
15 December 31, 2008.

16 SEC. 1006. EXTENSION OF AND INCREASE IN FIRST-TIME

17 HOMEBUYER CREDIT; WAIVER OF REQUIRE-
18 MENT TO REPAY.

19 | (a) EXTENSION.—

20 (1) IN GENERAL.—Section 36(h) is amended by
21 striking “July 1, 2009” and inserting ‘“‘December 1,
22 2009”.

23 (2) CONFORMING AMENDMENT.—Section 36(g)
24 is amended by striking “July 1, 2009” and inserting

25 “December 1, 2009,



O:\ERN\ERN09560.LC

O 0 1 AN U Bk~ WD

NN N N N /=) ks = e e = e e
AW N =) O VW 0 N W DRAWN-=D

S.L.C.
25
(b) INCREASE.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—Section 36(b) is amended by
striking “$7,500” each place it appears and insert-
ing “$8,000”.

(2) CONFORMING  AMENDMENT.—Section
36(b)(1)(B) is amended by striking “$3,750” and
inserting “$4,000”.

(¢c) WAIVER OF RECAPTURE.—

(1) INn GENERAL.—Paragraph (4) of section
36(f) 1s amended by adding at the end the following
new subparagraph:

“(D) WAIVER OF RECAPTURE FOR PUR-

CHASES IN 2009.—In the case of any credit al-

lowed with respect to the purchase of a prin-

cipal residence after December 31, 2008, and

before December 1, 2009—

“(i) paragraph (1) shall not apply,
and

“(ii) paragraph (2) shall apply only if
the disposition or cessation described in
paragraph (2) with respect to such resi-
dence occurs during the 36-month period
beginning on the date of the purchase of

such residence by the taxpayer.”.



O:\ERN\ERN09560.LC S.L.C.
26

1 (2) CONFORMING AMENDMENT.—Subsection (g)
2 of section 36 is amended by striking ‘“subsection
3 (¢)” and inserting ‘‘subsections (c¢) and (f)(4)(D)”.
4 (d) COORDINATION WITH FIRST-TIME HOMEBUYER
5 CREDIT FOR DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA.—

6 (1) IN GENERAL.—Subsection (e) of section
7 1400C is amended by adding at the end the fol-
8 lowing new paragraph:

9 “(4) COORDINATION WITH NATIONAL FIRST-
10 TIME HOMEBUYERS CREDIT.—No credit shall be al-
11 lowed under this section to any taxpayer with re-
12 spect to the purchase of a residence after December
13 31, 2008, and before December 1, 2009, if a credit
14 under section 36 is allowable to such taxpayer (or
15 the taxpayer’s spouse) with respect to such pur-
16 chase.”.

17 (2) CONFORMING AMENDMENT.—Section 36(d)
18 is amended by striking paragraph (1).

19 (e) REMOVAL OF PROHIBITION ON FINANCING BY

20 MORTGAGE REVENUE BONDS.—Section 36(d), as amend-
21 ed by subsection (¢)(2), is amended by striking paragraph
22 (2) and by redesignating paragraphs (3) and (4) as para-
23 graphs (1) and (2), respectively.



O:\ERN\ERN09560.LC S.L.C.

O 00 13 Y W B WD

NN N NN M/ o e e e e e
W N = O VW o0 3 O W A WNND-= o

27

(f) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by
this section shall apply to residences purchased after De-
cember 31, 2008.

SEC. 1007. SUSPENSION OF TAX ON PORTION OF UNEM-
PLOYMENT COMPENSATION.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 85 of the Internal Rev-
enue Code of 1986 (relating to unemployment compensa-
tion) is amended by adding at the end the following new
subsection:

“(¢) SPECIAL RULE FOR 2009.—In the case of any
taxable year beginning in 2009, gross income shall not m-
clude so much of the unemployment compensation received
by an individual as does not exceed $2,400.”.

(b) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendment made by
this section shall apply to taxable years beginning after
December 31, 2008.

SEC. 1008. ADDITIONAL DEDUCTION FOR STATE SALES TAX
AND EXCISE TAX ON THE PURCHASE OF CER-
TAIN MOTOR VEHICLES.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Subsection (a) of section 164 is
amended by inserting after paragraph (5) the following
new paragraph:

“(6) Qualified motor vehicle taxes.”.



O:\ERN\ERN09560.LC

S.L.C.
28

(b) QUALIFIED MOTOR VEHICLE TAXES.—Sub-
section (b) of section 164 is amended by adding at the

end the following new paragraph:

“(6) QUALIFIED MOTOR VEHICLE TAXES.—

“(A) IN GENERAL.—For purposes of this
section, the term ‘qualified motor vehicle taxes’
means any State or local sales or excise tax im-
posed on the purchase of a qualified motor vehi-
cle.

“(B) LIMITATION BASED ON VEHICLE
PRICE.—The amount of any State or local sales
or excise tax imposed on the purchase of a
qualified motor vehicle taken into aceount
under subparagraph (A) shall not exceed the
portion of such tax attributable to so much of
the purchase price as does not exceed $49,500.

“(C) INCOME LIMITATION.—The amount
otherwise taken ito account under subpara-
graph (A) (after the application of subpara-
graph (B)) for any taxable year shall be re-
duced (but not below zero) by the amount
which bears the same ratio to the amount which
18 80 treated as—

“(i) the excess (if any) of—



O:\ERN\ERNO09560.LC

O o0 3 &N L b~ W N -

N N N N N N /,) e e e e e
N A~ W D= O OV 0NN DWW R D

S.L.C.
29
“(I) the taxpayer’s modified ad-
justed gross income for such taxable
year, over
“(IT) $125,000 ($250,000 in the
case of a joint return), bears to
“(i1) $10,000.
For purposes of the preceding sentence, the
term ‘modified adjusted gross inecome’ means
the adjusted gross income of the taxpayer for
the taxable year (determined without regard to
sections 911, 931, and 933).
“(D) QUALIFIED MOTOR VEHICLE.—For
purposes of this paragraph—
“(i) IN GENERAL.—The term ‘quali-
fied motor vehicle’ means—
“I) a passenger automobile or
light truck which i1s treated as a
motor vehicle for purposes of title II
of the Clean Air Act, the gross vehicle
weight rating of which is not more
than 8,500 pounds, and the original
use of which commences with the tax-
payer,
“(IT) a motorcyele the gross vehi-

cle weight rating of which is not more



O:\ERN\ERN09560.LC

O 00 1 YN b W N =

N N N N N N = s e e e e e
L A W N =) © YV 0 3 O Wn AW NND-=o

S.L.C.
30
than 8500 pounds and the original

use of which commences with the tax-
payer, and

“(III) a motor home the original
use of which commences with the tax-
payer.

“(i1) OTHER TERMS.—The terms ‘mo-
toreycle’ and ‘motor home’ have the mean-
ings given such terms under section 571.3
of title 49, Code of Federal Regulations
(as In effect on the date of the enactment
of this paragraph).

“(E) QUALIFIED MOTOR VEHICLE TAXES
NOT INCLUDED IN COST OF ACQUIRED PROP-
ERTY.—The last sentence of subsection (a)
shall not apply to any qualified motor vehicle
taxes.

“(F) COORDINATION WITH GENERAL
SALES TAX.—This paragraph shall not apply in
the case of a taxpayer who makes an election
under paragraph (5) for the taxable year.

“(G) TERMINATION.— This paragraph
shall not apply to purchases after December 31,
2009.”.

(¢) DEDUCTION ALLOWED TO NONITEMIZERS.—



O:\ERN\ERNO09560.LC

O 00 N N D R W N

e S S S e e S = Y S G L G W G Ty
O o0 ~N1 O b A WN = O

and

[NC I \O TS N S L\
A W N =, O

S.L.C.
31

(1) IN GENERAL.—Paragraph (1) of section
63(c) is amended by striking “and” at the end of
subparagraph (C), by striking the period at the end
of subparagraph (D) and inserting ‘‘, and”, and by
adding at the end the following new subparagraph:

“(E) the motor vehicle sales tax deduec-
tion.”.

(2) DEFINITION.—Section 63(c¢) is amended by
adding at the end the following new paragraph:

“(9) MOTOR VEHICLE SALES TAX DEDUC-
TION.—For purposes of paragraph (1), the term
‘motor vehicle sales tax deduction’ means the
amount allowable as a deduction under section
164(a)(6). Such term shall not include any amount
taken into account under section 62(a).”.

(d) TREATMENT OF DEDUCTION UNDER ALTER-

NATIVE MINIMUM TAX.—The last sentence of section

56(b)(1)(E) is amended by striking “seection 63(¢)(1)(D)”

inserting “subparagraphs (D) and (E) of section

63(c)(1)”.

(e) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by

this section shall apply to purchases on or after the date
of the enactment of this Act in taxable years ending after

such date.



0:\ERN\ERN09560.LC SL.C.
32
1 PART II—ALTERNATIVE MINIMUM TAX RELIEF

SEC. 1011. EXTENSION OF ALTERNATIVE MINIMUM TAX RE-
LIEF FOR NONREFUNDABLE PERSONAL
CREDITS.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Paragraph (2) of section 26(a)

2008) is amended—

2

3

4

5

6 (relating to special rule for taxable years 2000 through
7

8 (1) by striking ‘““or 2008” and inserting ‘2008,
9

or 2009”, and

10 (2) by striking “2008” in the heading thereof
11 and inserting ‘“2009”’. |
12 (b) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by

13 this section shall apply to taxable years beginning after
14 December 31, 2008.

15 SEC. 1012. EXTENSION OF INCREASED ALTERNATIVE MIN-
16 IMUM TAX EXEMPTION AMOUNT.

17 (a) IN GENERAL.—Paragraph (1) of section 55(d)

18 (relating to exemption amount) is amended—

19 (1) by striking ‘“‘($69,950 in the case of taxable
20 years beginning in 2008)” in subparagraph (A) and
21 inserting “($70,950 in the case of taxable years be-
22 ginning in 2009)”, and

23 (2) by striking “($46,200 in the case of taxable
24 years beginning in 2008)” in subparagraph (B) and
25 inserting “($46,700 in the case of taxable years be-

26 ginning in 2009)”.



0:\ERN\ERN09560.LC | SL.C.

O 00 N &N U R W N -

N N /) = e e e e e e e
— O O 00 N N R W N = O

22
23
24
25

33

(b) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by
this section shall apply to taxable years beginning after
December 31, 2008.

Subtitle B—Energy Incentives
PART I—RENEWABLE ENERGY INCENTIVES
SEC. 1101. EXTENSION OF CREDIT FOR ELECTRICITY PRO-
DUCED FROM CERTAIN RENEWABLE RE-

SOURCES.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Subsection (d) of section 45 is
amended—

(1) by striking “2010” in paragraph (1) and in-
serting “2013”,

(2) by striking “2011” each place it appears in
paragraphs (2), (3), (4), (6), (7) and (9) and insert-
ing “2014”, and

(3) by striking “2012” in paragraph (11)(B)
and inserting “2014".

(b) TECHNICAL AMENDMENT.—Paragraph (5) of
section 45(d) is amended by striking “and before” and
all that follows and inserting “ and before October 3,
2008.”.

(¢) EFFECTIVE DATE.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—The amendments made by
subsection (a) shall apply to property placed in serv-

ice after the date of the enactment of this Act.



O:\ERN\ERN09560.LC S.L.C.
34

| (2) TECHNICAL AMENDMENT.—The amendment
2 made by subsection (b) shall take effect as if in-
3 cluded in section 102 of the Energy Improvement
4 and Extension Act of 2008.

5 SEC. 1102. ELECTION OF INVESTMENT CREDIT IN LIEU OF
6 PRODUCTION CREDIT.

7 (a) IN GENERAL.—Subsection (a) of section 48 is
8 amended by adding at the end the following new para-
9 graph:

10 “(5) ELECTION TO TREAT QUALIFIED FACILI-
11 TIES AS ENERGY PROPERTY.—

12 “(A) IN GENERAL.—In the case of any
13 qualified property which is part of a qualified
14 investment credit facility—

15 “(i) such property shall be treated as
16 energy property for purposes of this sec-
17 tion, and

18 (i) the energy percentage with re-
19 spect to such property shall be 30 percent.
20 “(B) DENIAL OF PRODUCTION CREDIT.—
21 No credit shall be allowed under section 45 for
22 any taxable year with respect to any qualified
23 investment credit facility.
24 “(C) QUALIFIED INVESTMENT CREDIT FA—
25 CILITY.—For purposes of this paragraph, the



O:\ERN\ERN09560.L.C

O 0 1 N L R W

e e e e e e T e S S S Gy Sy
O 00 I O Wwn AW N =, O

20
21
22
23
24
25

S.L.C.
35

term ‘qualified investment credit facility’ means
any of the following facilities if no credit has
been allowed under section 45 with respect to
such facility and the taxpayer makes an irrev-
ocable election to have this paragraph apply to
such facility:

‘(i) WIND FACILITIES.—Any qualified

facility (within the meaning of section 45)

described in paragraph (1) of section 45(d)

if such facility is placed in service in 2009,

2010, 2011, or 2012.

“(il) OTHER FACILITIES.—Any quali-
fied facility (within the meaning of section

45) described in paragraph (2), (3), (4),

(6), (7), (9), or (11) of section 45(d) if

such facility is placed in service in 2009,

2010, 2011, 2012, or 2013.

“(D) QUALIFIED PROPE‘RTY.—FOI' pur-
poses of this paragraph, the term ‘qualified
property’ means property—

“(1) which is—

“(I) tangible personal property,
or

“(IT) other tangible property (not

including a building or its structural



O:\ERN\ERN09560.L.C S.L.C.

O 00 9 O Wi AW

N N NN N N M ke R e e e

36

components), but only if such prop-

erty is used as an integral part of the

qualified investment credit facility,

and

“(i1) with respect to which deprecia-
tion (or amortization in lieu of deprecia-
tion) is allowable.”.

(b) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by
this section shall apply to facilities placed in service after
December 31, 2008.

SEC. 1103. REPEAL OF CERTAIN LIMITATIONS ON CREDIT
FOR RENEWABLE ENERGY PROPERTY.

(a) REPEAL OF LIMITATION ON CREDIT FOR QUALI-
FIED SMALL WIND ENERGY PROPERTY.—Paragraph (4)
of section 48(c) is amended by striking subparagraph (B)
and by redesignating subparagraphs (C) and (D) as sub-
paragraphs (B) and (C).

(b) REPEAL OF LIMITATION ON PROPERTY FI-
NANCED BY SUBSIDIZED ENERGY FINANCING.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—Section 48(a)(4) is amended
by adding at the end the following new subpara-
graph:

“(D) TeERMINATION.—This  paragraph

shall not apply to periods after December 31,

2008, under rules similar to the rules of section



O:\ERN\ERN09560.LC

O 00 N N i AW

N NN N N m ko e e e e e
NS N N es BN BN e < DN = ) Y &, T G 'S B N T S

S.L.C.
37
48(m) (as in effect on the day before the date

of the enactment of the Revenue Reconciliation

Act of 1990).”.

(2) CONFORMING AMENDMENTS.—

(A) Section 25C(e)(1) is amended by strik-

ing “(8), and (9)” and inserting ‘“and (8)”.

(B) Section 25D(e) is amended by striking

paragraph (9).

(C) Section 48A(b)(2) is amended by in-

serting ‘‘(without regard to subparagraph (D)

thereof)’’ after “section 48(a)(4)”.

(D) Section 48B(b)(2) is amended by in-

serting “(without regard to subparagraph (D)

thereof)” after “section 48(a)(4)”.

(¢) EFFECTIVE DATE.—

(1) INn GENERAL.—Except as provided in para-
graph (2), the amendment made by this section shall
apply to periods after December 31, 2008, under
rules similar to the rules of section 48(m) of the In-
ternal Revenue Code of 1986 (as in effect on the day
before the date of the enactment of the Revenue
Reconciliation Act of 1990).

(2) CONFORMING AMENDMENTS.—The amend-

ments made by subparagraphs (A) and (B) of sub-



O:\ERN\ERN09560.LC S.L.C.

1

O o0 3 N MW

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

38

section (b)(2) shall apply to taxable years beginning

after December 31, 2008.
SEC. 1104. COORDINATION WITH RENEWABLE ENERGY

GRANTS.

Section 48 is amended by adding at the end the fol-
lowing new subsection:

“(d) COORDINATION WITH DEPARTMENT OF TREAS-
URY GRANTS.—In the case of any property with respect
to which the Secretary makes a grant under section 1603
of the American Recovery and Reinvestment Tax Act of
2009—

“(1) DENIAL OF PRODUCTION AND INVEST-
MENT CREDITS.—No credit shall be determined
under this section or section 45 with respect to such

~ property for the taxable year in which such grant is
made or any subsequent taxable year.

“(2) RECAPTURE OF CREDITS FOR PROGRESS
EXPENDITURES MADE BEFORE GRANT.—If a credit
was determined under this section with respect to
such property for any taxable year ending before
such grant i1s made—

“(A) the tax imposed under subtitle A on
the taxpayer for the taxable year in which such
grant i1s made shall be increased by so much of

such credit as was allowed under section 38,



O:\ERN\ERN09560.LC S.L.C

39

1 “(B) the general business carryforwards
2 under section 39 shall be adjusted so as to re-
3 capture the portion of such credit which was
4 not so allowed, and

5 “(C) the amount of such grant shall be de-
6 termined without regard to any reduction in the
7 basis of such property by reason of such credit.
8 “(3) TREATMENT OF GRANTS.—Any such grant
9 shall—
10 “(A) not be includible in the gross income
11 of the taxpayer, but
12 “(B) shall be taken into account in deter-
13 mining the basis of the property to which such
14 grant relates, except that the basis of such
15 property shall be reduced under section 50(e) in
16 the same manner as a credit allowed under sub-
17 section (a).”.

18 PART II—INCREASED ALLOCATIONS OF NEW
19 CLEAN RENEWABLE ENERGY BONDS AND
20 QUALIFIED ENERGY CONSERVATION BONDS
2] SEC. 1111. INCREASED LIMITATION ON ISSUANCE OF NEW
22 CLEAN RENEWABLE ENERGY BONDS.

23 Subsection (c) of section 54C is amended by adding

24 at the end the following new paragraph:



O:\ERN\ERN09560.LC

O 0 9 N b WN

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19